Fatekh Vergasov

From: Fatekh Vergasov [fv1946@sbcglobal.net]
Sent: Thursday, March 08, 2012 2:58 PM

To: 'Felizardo Inzunza'

Subject: RE: invoice for final payment
Felizardo,

As you've stated recintly our contract has nature "Labor and Materials",
http://en.wikipedia.org/wiki/Labor_and_materials

and I agre with you. That’s why, I am concerning about "Materials", which balance is

Balance = Materials actually installed at the roof (may be calculated very preciselly) +
materials brocken and dumped as per reciept sent to me by you + 4 boxes of tile, which you
took from my site

Would you please provide me all calculation necessary to determinate Materials Balance
mentioned above?

Regards
Fatekh Vergasov

————— Original Message————-—

From: Felizardo Inzunza [mailto:calstyleroofing@yahoo.com]
Sent: Thursday, March 08, 2012 12:16 PM

To: Fatekh Vergasov

Subject: invoice for final payment

Hi Mr Fatekh

here is the invoice for final payment on roof.
thanks.

Felix
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